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August 12, 2016 ( * A
Jeff Thorn o ’

City of Lee’s Summit, Missouri
220 SE Green Street
Lee’s Summit, MO 64063

Re: Tudor Road Pump Station — Flood Work Electrical

R.F. Fisher Electric Company, LLC is pleased to offer the following proposal for the electrical portion of the aforementioned
project. Our proposal is as follows:

Proposal #i: Flood Damage
1. Demo out high bay, fluorescent and exit light fixtures

2. Deino out conduits cn walls submerged and fittings; safe off and pull out wire

3. Run rigid conduit, fittings, boxes to repiace exposed conduits for outlets and switches to mirror those demoed out; pull
in new wire

4. Demo out ouilets and switches affected; replace and pull new wire
Provide (7) hibay lights with gripple aircraft cable safety hanger; (18) 4° fluorescent lights vaportite LED fixtures; (3)

emergency exit light LED with battery backup, ai! installed in exact same locations _

Provide elevator shafi fixture, vapottite jelly jar, and pump outlet

Provide (2) double duplex receptacle at ferric pumps

Wire in new sump pump control panel (furnished and installed by others;) check operation; label pane] and wiring

All work to be performed during normal working hours; no overtime included in scope of work

10. Not inctuded in RFF Scope of Work, to be performed by others as directed: parts under water, dual sumps controller;
pressure switches; RTD’s; valve accuator position switches; solencid vaives vibration sensors; and elevator controls;
all stated items by others as directed.

PRICE PROPGSAL #1: $54,450.00
Fifty-Four Thousand Four Hundred Fifty Dollars and 0/100 cents
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1. Horizontal power bore™rew.g
At controller end excavate and tuitriaig cabinet with 17 rigid rag roy coated pips

2. :
3. Furnish and instail 3-wire shielded cabie fronrsaute tie into controller flow meter by others as directed
4,  All work to be performed durin prret] erttme-ingluded in scope of work

$5,070.00
Five Thousand Seventy Dollars and G/10(F cents

Thank yeu for the opportunity to bid on this project. Feel free to call me at (913) 261-0616 if there are any questions.

Sincerely,
R. F. Fisher Electric Company, Inc.

Som Volerds

Sam Valenti



Joe Frogge

From: Jeff Thorn

Sent: Wednesday, September 07, 2016 4:05 PM
To: Joe Frogge

Subject: FW: Tudor Road Pump Station permit

From: Brent Boice

Sent: Wednesday, September 07, 2016 4:02 PM
To: Jeff Thorn

Subject: RE: Tudor Road Pump Station permit

Please use 500 83 200 054 — 7306. If they could identify the charges as TUDOR ROAD PUMP STATION — EMERGENCY
that would be helpful.

Youurs Truty,

Brent Boice | Assistant Director of Support Service
220 SE Green Street | Lee's Summit, MO 64063

816.969.1920 ||swater.net | Brent.Boice@cityofls.net
LS WATER UTILITIES

*} LEE'S SUMMIT

From: Jeff Thorn

Sent: Wednesday, September 07, 2016 3:51 PM
To: Brent Boice

Subject: FW: Tudor Road Pump Station permit

We need account # to send to Joe for Tudor Elec Permit for Fisher.

Vours Truly,

Jeff Thorn, P.E. | Assistant Director of Engineering Services
220 SE Green Street | Lee's Summit, MO 64063

816 969.1922 |lswater.net | Jeff. Thorn@cityofls.net
) WATER UTHITIES

M LEE'S SUMMIT

From: Joe Frogge

Sent: Wednesday, September 07, 2016 3:27 PM
To: Jeff Thorn

Subject: Tudor Road Pump Station permit

Jeff,
Permit is ready to go. My off the hip estimate was way off. $372.49



